
 

 

WHAT TO EXPECT AS YOU COME BACK TO CHURCH: 

Temperature Monitoring at Front Entrance 

Volunteers will check your temperature with contactless thermometers before you enter our 
facilities. If you are showing signs of a fever (100.4° F or higher), you will be asked to worship 
online. 

Face Masks are Required 

For the safety of everyone, we are requiring that everyone (over age 2) who attends worship 
wear a face mask. You may bring your own, or we will have some provided. 

Hand Sanitizers Provided 

Although not recommended to replace good handwashing, we will be providing hand sanitizer 
for your use. There are two stationary, automatic dispensers – in the Foyer near the entrance out 
in the hallway for use.  There are also hand-pump hand sanitizers in many places throughout the 
building for your use including hallway by the fellowship hall. 

Our goal is to provide a Touchless Environment 

In our effort to provide a touchless environment, doors will be propped open and we have 
removed as much touchable items as possible.  This includes the space area the kids will be 
doing their Sunday programs.  Hand sanitizers and tissues or paper towels are available where 
touching is unavoidable (i.e. bathrooms).  Kids will be strongly encouraged to wash their 
hands prior to entering the Children’s ministry area. 

Practice Social Distancing 

Please remember to maintain a safe physical distance of at least 6-7 feet apart. Seating has been 
arranged in the Sanctuary for safe distancing.  Family groups may sit together, please remain in 
your own area during worship. We will dismiss as directed following services to avoid crowded 



hallways. Our Foyer area cannot be a spot to hang out and chat, please use the parking lot for 
that. While we cannot hug or shake hands, it’s ok to smile and wave! Or give air high-fives! 

Nursery Childcare will Not be Available 

We will not have childcare in the Nursery but infants will be welcomed in worship and seen as 
a blessing, not a distraction. Children who want to stay in the sanctuary will sit with their 
families during worship.  Preschool & Elementary age children will be in the fellowship hall 
areas. 

Amenities: Coffee, Bulletins, and Prayer Lists 

We have suspended the coffee service in the Coffee Area and all water fountains are covered 
and out of use to reduce commonly touched surfaces and the spread of germs. Please do not 
bring any food or drinks into the building. The sermon notes are available on our website!  
Monthly Communion elements will be distributed in individual servings as a prepackaged all-
in-one wafer and juice cup at the end of services as your family goes out of the building. 

Offering Collection 

An offering will not be taken by passing the plate; instead, we will leave the plates at the 
Sanctuary exits for individuals to drop their tithes and offerings. Online giving is also still an 
option! 

Cleaning, Disinfecting, and Sanitizing 

The campus is on a regular cleaning and sanitization schedule during the week to prepare spaces 
before and after their next use.  Volunteers and children’s ministry team members will be 
disinfecting chairs, sanitizing contact surfaces and cleaning before and after service. 
 
Drop-off & Pick-up of Children 
 
Families will check at the front of the church entrance and from there have the option to stay 
together in the service or let volunteers and youth to take kids to Children’s ministry areas in 
Fellowship Hall.  After service kids will be brought up to the front of the foyer for parents to 
pick up as they make their way out of the building. 

If in Doubt or Immunocompromised – Please continue to Worship Online 

We are all in this together. People who feel sick should worship online. Contact and follow 
the advice of your medical provider. If you are immunocompromised, you may want to 
continue to worship online for now. We miss you all, but our goal is to make sure everyone 
stays healthy and safe! 
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